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Let’s Dream
Indoor rollator
Black  
Orange 

TCLD502 
TCLD501

Technical specifications:

Tested according to ISO 11199-2:2005

Max. user weight
Width
Weight
Handle height
is adjustable from
Max. tray load
Max. basket load
Black tray included

100 kg
55 cm
6.5 kg

83 – 95 cm
5 kg
3 kg  

Let´s Dream, the worldwide success 
from TrustCare, is a very practical 
walking aid for people who need a 
light and �exible rolling aid for indoor 
use. It also has a beautiful and elegant 
design. Available in two di�erent 
colors. It is easy to operate and easy to 
use in norrow spaces such as in the 
bathroom. It has a removable tray for 
transporting, for example, a plate or a 
cup of co�ee. You can use it as a food 
trolley, a small table to eat from, and as 
a support if you need to get up from 
bed in the middle of the night. A fabric 
basket is available as an accessory and 
can be used together with the tray.

The handles are clad with soft foam 
rubber, adjustable in height to �t 
di�erent statures. The brake can easily 
be operated with only one hand and is 
active on both rear wheels. The rollator 
also has of course a parking brake. It 
can be easily folded and can stand 
alone when it is folded. 

83 – 95 cm 68 cm

40 cm

55 cm28 cm

Transparent Tray

Fabric Basket
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